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It takes know-how to create a professional looking clown face. Contrary to popular belief a proper clown
face is not worn as a mask. It should be designed to compliment the natural features in the face in order to
enhance the clown's expressions.

In this book Jim Roberts, a.k.a. Strutter the Clown, describes the different types of clown faces and how you
can design a unique face of your own. He provides detailed step-by-step directions for applying makeup to
create the three basic clown face types: Whiteface, Auguste, and Tramp.

Included are tips on powdering, applying rubber and putty noses, how to handle eyeglasses, handling
common makeup problems, and proper makeup selection and removal.

Includes full-color, close-up photos which offer step-by-step directions for applying makeup.
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From reader reviews:

Mark Gatling:

This Strutter's Complete Guide to Clown Makeup book is not really ordinary book, you have after that it the
world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is actually information inside this guide
incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get.
This Strutter's Complete Guide to Clown Makeup without we understand teach the one who reading it
become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't be worry Strutter's Complete Guide to Clown Makeup
can bring if you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it
within your lovely laptop even cell phone. This Strutter's Complete Guide to Clown Makeup having very
good arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Johnny Powers:

The reason why? Because this Strutter's Complete Guide to Clown Makeup is an unordinary book that the
inside of the book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will distress you with the secret the idea inside.
Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who else write the book in such amazing way makes the
content interior easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is
good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This book will give
you a lot of advantages than the other book possess such as help improving your ability and your critical
thinking method. So , still want to delay having that book? If I had been you I will go to the guide store
hurriedly.

John Hill:

It is possible to spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This Strutter's Complete Guide
to Clown Makeup is simple to develop you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and soon. If
you did not have much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you easier
to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will
get when you buy this book.

Mathew Casillas:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our know-how for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year ended up
being exactly added. This publication Strutter's Complete Guide to Clown Makeup was filled about science.
Spend your time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has several feel
when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can experience enjoy to
read a publication. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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