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This paper presents unique evidence on health workers' career choices in Ethiopia. It shows that challenges
like health workers' limited willingness to work in rural areas, as well as their likelihood to migrate abroad
vary substantially and are correlated with background, motivation, and job satisfaction. Governments in
Africa have identified human resources for health as a priority to improve health outcomes. This study is a
valuable resource to better understand health worker choices and help toward the design of more effective
human resource policies.

This working paper was produced as part of the World Bank’s Africa Region Health Systems for Outcomes
(HSO) Program. The Program, funded by the World Bank, the Government of Norway, the Government of
the United Kingdom and the Global Alliance for Vaccines and Immunization (GAVI), focuses on
strengthening health systems in Africa to reach the poor and achieve tangible results related to Health,
Nutrition and Population. The main pillars and focus of the program center on knowledge and capacity
building related to Human Resources for Health, Health Financing, Pharmaceuticals, Governance and
Service Delivery, and Infrastructure and ICT.
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Kidwell:

The book Discovering the Real World: Health Workers' Career Choices and Early Work Experience in
Ethiopia (World Bank Working Papers) make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your
capable far more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting stress or having big
problem with the subject. If you can make reading through a book Discovering the Real World: Health
Workers' Career Choices and Early Work Experience in Ethiopia (World Bank Working Papers) to be your
habit, you can get more advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all
subjects. You can know everything if you like available and read a guide Discovering the Real World:
Health Workers' Career Choices and Early Work Experience in Ethiopia (World Bank Working Papers).
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you
think about this book?

Jose Tiernan:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also get a life style. This reading addiction give you lot of
advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book that will
improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of reserve you read, if
you want get more knowledge just go with training books but if you want feel happy read one using theme
for entertaining like comic or novel. Often the Discovering the Real World: Health Workers' Career Choices
and Early Work Experience in Ethiopia (World Bank Working Papers) is kind of reserve which is giving the
reader erratic experience.

Donald Murray:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you might have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you already been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Discovering the Real World:
Health Workers' Career Choices and Early Work Experience in Ethiopia (World Bank Working Papers), you
could enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh
occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Kim Nielsen:

As a scholar exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library in order
to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart or real
their interest. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to presently there
but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and also can't



see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know
that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to
reach Chinese's country. So , this Discovering the Real World: Health Workers' Career Choices and Early
Work Experience in Ethiopia (World Bank Working Papers) can make you experience more interested to
read.
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