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Blame it on Cinderella: We get married because we want to believe that true love and lasting happiness are
possible, but all too often, our choice of a mate is based on flawed assumptions and unrealistic expectations.
We have an idealistic view of how our love relationship should be, but we ignore the work it takes to create
and sustain that healthy lasting love. We expect a loving relationship to make us happy, without knowing
what happiness means for us. The Purpose of Love is for anyone currently in a love relationship or in search
of one. It is a guidebook to help you figure out what you need to be happy — first with yourself and then as
part of a loving couple. This book will help you identify what you want in a life partner and heal old wounds
from the past. It is only when we realize that we alone are responsible for our own happiness that are we free
to be in a relationship without needing the other person to "make us happy." With thought-provoking
strategies and practical advice, psychotherapist Dorothy Ratusny guides the reader through the work it takes
to find the right partner and to build and nurture a strong, satisfying love relationship. Some of the proceeds
from the sale of this book will be donated to the Children's Aid Society and the Ontario Society for the
Prevention of Cruelty to Animals.
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From reader reviews:

Paul Henson:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As you may know that
book is very important for all of us. The book The Purpose of Love: A guidebook for defining and
cultivating your most significant relationship was making you to know about other understanding and of
course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you. The reserve The Purpose of Love: A
guidebook for defining and cultivating your most significant relationship is not only giving you much more
new information but also to get your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your current spend
time to read your book. Try to make relationship together with the book The Purpose of Love: A guidebook
for defining and cultivating your most significant relationship. You never feel lose out for everything when
you read some books.

Christopher Riley:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
practice give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge even the
information inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on
what kind of e-book you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want
experience happy read one with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Often the The Purpose of
Love: A guidebook for defining and cultivating your most significant relationship is kind of reserve which is
giving the reader unstable experience.

Manuel Rose:

This The Purpose of Love: A guidebook for defining and cultivating your most significant relationship
usually are reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The reason why of this The Purpose of
Love: A guidebook for defining and cultivating your most significant relationship can be one of several great
books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed you with
information that maybe will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it just
about everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed people. Beside that this The Purpose
of Love: A guidebook for defining and cultivating your most significant relationship forcing you to have an
enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we all know it
useful in your day task. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Martha Fincher:

This book untitled The Purpose of Love: A guidebook for defining and cultivating your most significant
relationship to be one of several books that will best seller in this year, that's because when you read this
publication you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book shop
or you can order it by using online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily



to read this book, since you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason for your
requirements to past this reserve from your list.
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