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This second edition of scholar Arthur Goldschmidt presents a concise survey of Egyptian history since the
mid-eighteenth century. It focuses on Egypt's evolution as a nation-state, dispelling common misconceptions
about Egypt's modern history. Professor Goldschmidt calls upon recent Egyptian and Western scholarship to
document pivotal points, such as the 1952 revolution, and to illuminate controversies, such as those
surrounding Sadat's role in the 1973 war with Israel. Modern Egypt is anecdotal as well as authoritative,
covering social history, religion, politics, economics, military history, geography, and even the psychology
of selected leaders. Faruq's impotence, Nasir's paranoia, and Sadat's glamour are all presented as they relate
to policy motivations and outcomes. Modern Egypt paves the way to a clear understanding of events leading
up to the Camp David accords of 1978 and then points beyond them to the emergent Muslim opposition,
Sadat's assassination, and Mubarak's regime.This book is directed to students, journalists, diplomats, foreign
visitors and long-term residents, and businesspeople who need to be familiar with Egypt, its role in Middle
East affairs, and its involvement with the nations of the world."
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From reader reviews:

Rosemarie Pickett:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time? Sure,
you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open as well as read a book titled Modern Egypt:
The Formation of a Nation State? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You understand beside you can
spend your time with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion
or you have additional opinion?

Mary Fox:

Here thing why that Modern Egypt: The Formation of a Nation State are different and trusted to be yours.
First of all looking at a book is good but it depends in the content of it which is the content is as yummy as
food or not. Modern Egypt: The Formation of a Nation State giving you information deeper and in different
ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no book that similar with Modern Egypt: The
Formation of a Nation State. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your personal eyes about
the thing in which happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. You can easily
bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your technique home by train. Should you be having
difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of Modern Egypt: The Formation of a Nation
State in e-book can be your alternative.

Jennifer Stephens:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to read a book. When you
go through a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, simply because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on
what forms of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, along
with soon. The Modern Egypt: The Formation of a Nation State provide you with new experience in
studying a book.

Margaret Padua:

You can obtain this Modern Egypt: The Formation of a Nation State by check out the bookstore or Mall. Just
viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this
book are various. Not only by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by simply e-book.
In the modern era such as now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what their problem.
Right now, choose your own personal ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to
arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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