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Diana Thompson was raised in poverty by a devout Christian mother, but after her mother's death, Diana
denounces God's existence. Now she's living the successful life she always dreamed about as a child, but
she's still plagued with insecurities that drive her to doubt her husband's love for her. To make matters worse,
she has to deal with the void in her heart from the guilt of an unforgettable act she committed and hid from
her husband. Kendra Staten, Diana's best friend from childhood, struggled to climb out of the impoverished
life she lived. Unlike Diana's religious upbringing, Kendra was raised by a mother with immoral standards.
Against all odds, Kendra gave her life to Christ and strives to be a virtuous wife and First Lady at her
husband's church. But Kendra's faith and integrity will soon be tested by a present tragedy, as well as a past
mistake. Pricilla Battle and Aquila Savino, friends since they were both orphaned as children, are dealing
with their own difficulties. Pricilla moves to Raleigh, North Carolina in search of her true identity, not
knowing that the man she falls in loves with just might hold the key. Aquila flees from an abusive husband
and moves in with Pricilla. She struggles to pursue a new life for herself; however, she will soon discover
that the solace of the new home she cherishes will be short lived. These four women will have to make some
very difficult decisions and search for help from God to get through trying times.
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From reader reviews:

Lisa Gaither:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that e-book has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are really reading whatever
they take because their hobby will be reading a book. Think about the person who don't like reading a book?
Sometime, particular person feel need book if they found difficult problem as well as exercise. Well,
probably you'll have this Desperate Decisions (Urban Books).

Donovan Pena:

This Desperate Decisions (Urban Books) tend to be reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful
person, why. The reason why of this Desperate Decisions (Urban Books) can be one of many great books
you must have is actually giving you more than just simple studying food but feed anyone with information
that might be will shock your before knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it all over the
place and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed versions. Beside that this Desperate Decisions
(Urban Books) forcing you to have an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you trial run
of critical thinking that could it useful in your day task. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Eulalia Perry:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, about to beach,
or picnic inside the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different
to fill your current free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book can be option to fill your no cost
time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want
to try look for book, may be the reserve untitled Desperate Decisions (Urban Books) can be fine book to
read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Carlie Manson:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is unique. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is known as of
book Desperate Decisions (Urban Books). You can add your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the
printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most significant that, you must
aware about reserve. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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