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Linux Filesystems focuses on two different aspects of filesystems for Linux. First, local filesystems which
use journaling, including SGI's XFS; IBM's EFS; Red Hat's extfs3, and Reiser. Second, it discusses
distributed network-oriented filesystems such as: NFS, the classic distributed filesystem originally written by
Sun Microsystems and since ported to every Unix and Linux platform.; OpenAFS, a version of
IBM/Transarc's networked filesystem that was recently released into the public domain by IBM; Netatalk,
the package for Linux interoperability with Macintosh filesystems; Samba, the package for Linux
interoperability with Windows SMB filesystems, and NCP tools (Novell Core Protocols), the tools
supporting Linux interoperability with Novell's NetWare.
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From reader reviews:

Julia Gilmore:

The ability that you get from Linux Filesystems is the more deep you excavating the information that hide
into the words the more you get serious about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to be aware
of but Linux Filesystems giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in a
number of way that can be understood by simply anyone who read this because the author of this publication
is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to
understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for
having this kind of Linux Filesystems instantly.

William Lee:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the headline Linux
Filesystems suitable to you? The particular book was written by renowned writer in this era. The book
untitled Linux Filesystemsis a single of several books in which everyone read now. This specific book was
inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new dimension
that you ever know prior to. The author explained their idea in the simple way, therefore all of people can
easily to know the core of this e-book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. So
that you can see the represented of the world on this book.

Christopher Thompson:

The e-book with title Linux Filesystems includes a lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a
lot of advantage after read this book. This book exist new expertise the information that exist in this
publication represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to know how the
improvement of the world. This book will bring you inside new era of the globalization. You can read the e-
book on the smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Rosalind Bowlin:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is different. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
top book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is known as of book
Linux Filesystems. You can include your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it could
add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about
guide. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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