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Archaeologists and anthropologists discover other civilizations; science fiction writers invent them. In this
collection of her major essays, Marleen Barr argues that feminist science fiction writers contribute to
postmodern literary canons with radical alternatives to mainstream patriarchal society. Because feminist
science fiction challenges male-centered social imperatives, it has been marginalized and dismissed from the
canon--thus, lost in space. Moving beyond feminist science fiction itself, Barr goes on to examine other
literary genres from the perspective of 'feminist fabulation'--a term she has coined to encompass science
fiction, fantasy, utopian literature, and mainstream literature that critiques patriarchal fictions. Discussing the
works of such writers as Margaret Atwood, Joanna Russ, Salman Rushdie, Paul Theroux, Ursula Le Guin,
Herman Melville, Saul Bellow, Edgar Allan Poe, and Marge Piercy, Barr illuminates feminist science
fiction's connections to other literary traditions and contemporary canons. Her critical analysis yields a new
and expanded understanding of feminist creativity.
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From reader reviews:

Eric Campanelli:

The book Lost in Space: Probing Feminist Science Fiction and Beyond can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. So just why must we leave a very important thing like a book Lost in
Space: Probing Feminist Science Fiction and Beyond? A number of you have a different opinion about
guide. But one aim this book can give many data for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer
together with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you can give for each other; it is possible
to share all of these. Book Lost in Space: Probing Feminist Science Fiction and Beyond has simple shape
however, you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by
start and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

William Mayer:

What do you concerning book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man? If you
don't have spare time to perform others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have
spare time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question
simply because just their can do in which. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it
is suitable. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this kind of Lost in Space: Probing
Feminist Science Fiction and Beyond to read.

Marlin Brogan:

As people who live in the modest era should be update about what going on or details even knowledge to
make these people keep up with the era which can be always change and move forward. Some of you maybe
will update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming to
you actually is you don't know what one you should start with. This Lost in Space: Probing Feminist Science
Fiction and Beyond is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because book
serves what you want and need in this era.

Yolanda Sartain:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen have to have book to know the revise information of year to year. As we know
those guides have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. From the book Lost in Space: Probing Feminist Science Fiction and Beyond we can consider more
advantage. Don't that you be creative people? To be creative person must like to read a book. Merely choose
the best book that suited with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life with that book Lost in
Space: Probing Feminist Science Fiction and Beyond. You can more attractive than now.
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