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Bone cements are widely used in orthopaedic applications to anchor implants to existing bone, reconstruct
bone and deliver bioactive agents to the body. With an increasing number of bone cements available, it is
vital that the correct material is selected for specific clinical procedures. Orthopaedic bone cements reviews
the most recent research in this field.

Part one discusses the current uses of orthopaedic bone cements with chapters on such topics as hip
replacements, verteboplasty and wear particles and osteolysis. Part two reviews materials and types of
cement such as acrylic, polymethylmethacrylate and calcium phosphate cements. Chapters in Part three
address the mechanical properties of bone cements such as fracture toughness and dynamic creep. The final
section examines methods to enhance the properties of bone cements with coverage of themes such as
antibiotic loaded bone cements and bioactive cements.

With its eminent editor and multidisciplinary team of international contributors, Orthopaedic bone cements is
an invaluable reference for materials scientists, medical researchers and all those involved in the
development of bone cements for orthopaedic applications and joint replacement.

Provides a review of recent research focussing on improving the mechanical and biological performance of●

bone cements
Discusses the current applications of bone cements particularly in hip replacement, verteboplasty and wear●

particles
Reviews types of materials and acrylic, polymethlymethacrylate and calcium phosphate as types of●

cements
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From reader reviews:

Richard Vazquez:

The book Orthopaedic Bone Cements (Woodhead Publishing Series in Biomaterials) can give more
knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. So just why must we leave a
good thing like a book Orthopaedic Bone Cements (Woodhead Publishing Series in Biomaterials)? A
number of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim this book can give many information
for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or info that you
take for that, you are able to give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book Orthopaedic Bone
Cements (Woodhead Publishing Series in Biomaterials) has simple shape but you know: it has great and big
function for you. You can appear the enormous world by open up and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Lewis Tuggle:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot
of information that can give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can easily share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their particular reader with their
story or maybe their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the textbooks. But also they write about
the data about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your sons
or daughters, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to
improve their skill in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write on their book. One of them is
this Orthopaedic Bone Cements (Woodhead Publishing Series in Biomaterials).

Odis Hillyard:

You are able to spend your free time to study this book this guide. This Orthopaedic Bone Cements
(Woodhead Publishing Series in Biomaterials) is simple to create you can read it in the park your car, in the
beach, train and soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the printed book, you can buy often the e-
book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. And so there are a
lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Ward Beaver:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got scholars? We believe that that query
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person similar to reading or as studying become their hobby. You should know that reading
is very important along with book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except
your teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update in relation to something by book. A substantial
number of sorts of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is actually Orthopaedic
Bone Cements (Woodhead Publishing Series in Biomaterials).
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