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Stories from the Street is a theological exploration of interviews with men and women who had experienced
homelessness at some stage in their lives. Framed within a theology of story and a theology of liberation,
Nixon suggests that story is not only a vehicle for creating human transformation but it is one of God's
chosen means of effecting change. Short biographies of twelve characters are examined under themes
including: crises in health and relationships, self-harm and suicide, anger and pain, God and the Bible.
Expanding the existing literature of contextual theology, this book provides an alternative focus to a church-
shaped mission by advocating with, and for, a very marginal group; suggesting that their experiences have
much to teach the church. Churches are perceived as being active in terms of pastoral work, but reluctant to
ask more profound questions about why homelessness exists at all. A theology of homelessness suggests not
just a God of the homeless, but a homeless God, who shares stories and provides hope. Engaging with
contemporary political and cultural debates about poverty, housing and public spending, Nixon presents a
unique theological exploration of homeless people, suffering, hope and the human condition.
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From reader reviews:

Nicholas Walsh:

Many people spending their period by playing outside using friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It okay you
can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Stories from the Street: A
Theology of Homelessness which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.

Madeline Williams:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This specific book Stories from the Street: A Theology of
Homelessness was colourful and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Stories from the
Street: A Theology of Homelessness has many kinds or style. Start from kids until adolescents. For example
Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of
book are generally make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best
book for you personally and try to like reading which.

Rosemary Lafleur:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got learners? We believe that that query
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you know
that little person such as reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important along with book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update with regards to something by book. A substantial
number of sorts of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is actually Stories from the Street:
A Theology of Homelessness.

Michael Martin:

A lot of people said that they feel weary when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half portions of the book. You can choose often the book Stories from the Street: A
Theology of Homelessness to make your own reading is interesting. Your skill of reading ability is
developing when you such as reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the
feeling about book and reading through especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to wide open a
book and go through it. Beside that the publication Stories from the Street: A Theology of Homelessness can
to be your new friend when you're feel alone and confuse using what must you're doing of this time.
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